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You are a person who cares about the future of health?  
 
If this is true and you think that healthcare deserves great digital solutions - and if you have a 
background as a 
 

Fullstack Software Engineer 
 
Then pls join our team.  
 
We’re  building the patient interaction of the future: Our mobile health as a Service solution enables 
healthcare providers to interact with patients seamlessly, easily and securely. The integrated app 
acts as a digital health companion that organizes appointments, enables people to care for each 
other and keeps everything important at hand. Highest security standards applied. The solution is 
multi-lingual and “mobile first”. 
 
Sounds interesting? It is :)  
 
What heyPatient offers as your future workplace 
We use the latest technologies in a rapidly changing market. This and the agility of a startup make 
us an exciting place to work. You can also look forward to working with a friendly, diverse and 
innovative team. You will play a crucial role, bring new ideas and implement them. We’re open to 
home office. 
 
You help develop our "Digital Health as a Service" solution end-to-end. In direct cooperation with 
other developers, project managers and customers, you will design and program new features for 
health care providers and for our end customers who use heyPatient as a digital health companion. 
  
As a full stack developer, you will feel comfortable working with both front-end and back-end coding 
languages, development frameworks and third-party libraries. Ideally, you have professional 
experience in healthcare, are a team player, have an eye for visual design and a feel for product 
benefits. If you are also familiar with agile methods and like to take on responsibility, the match is 
perfect and you should not miss to contact us. 
 
You’re part of a team 

• You work in close collaboration with CTO, development and product-/project teams 

• You’re responsible for your field of work and have an active involvement from the idea to 
implementation 

 

What you need for this task 

• You are amiliar with HL7 FHIR and other industry standards (3+ years); 

• Software development experience (5+ years); 

• Solid knowledge of Python, GraphQL, PostgreSQL, RESTful APIs. 

• Good knowledge of using Microsoft Azure Cloud Services, Docker (bonus: Kubernetes); 

• Familiar with design and architecture patterns (e.g. microservices) as well as DevOps and SRE 
principles; 

• Experience with agile development methods, data protection and data security requirements; 

• Degree in computer science or equivalent; 

• Professionally fluent in written and spoken English and German; 

• You are a team player, like to take responsibility, enjoy new challenges and finding suitable 
solutions. 

 
Nice to have 

• Experience with medical device certification; 

• Experience with frontend frameworks like React JS or Angular 

• Knowledge of Clojure 

• French, Italian and other languages an advantage 
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We offer 

• Excellent work-life balance, attractive remuneration and working conditions 

• A thorough introduction 

• Location-independent work (home office and/or work in the heyPatient office or on-site at 
customers) depending on preference, agreement and projects 

• Opportunity to participate in professional conferences and expert circles 

• exciting new topics in a rapidly changing environment 

• personal training & development 

• Attractive compensation and terms of employment. 
 
 
You can find out more about us here: www.heypatient.com.  

http://www.heypatient.com/

